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Abstract 

 
Bidayuh Pantun or Patun  remains  a under researched topic  in Borneo studies and 
language research   due to the   difficulties associated with  obtaining  critical, poetic 
information in oral culture, language  variations and societal mobility.  Existing data 
from anthologies however provide little detail about the instrinsic and extrinsic 
features ascribed to the poem by the people who produce and use them.  This paper 
attempts to explore patun from the Jagoi community. In this study, the structural 
aspects, themes and moral values of 47 patun from the Jagoi community were 
analysed. The initial explanations suggested by the poet were further analysed to 
determine the various structural features to place it alongside existing mainstream 
lyric poetry. The analysis of the intrinsic features showed that good rhythmic patun 
has four to six words per line and eight to 12 syllables per line, and the final syllables 
of each line has assonance and consonance patterns of a-a-a-a and a-b-a-b. The 
themes of the patun include love, advice, forgiveness, beliefs, hopelessness and 
happiness, and the moral values take the form of subtle advice and admonishments. 
The Bidayuh patun is indeed a projection of knowledge, experiences, beliefs, values, 
and emotions of the community. 
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Introduction 

 
The Bidayuh community in Sarawak is the second largest indigenous group in 
Sarawak, after the Iban, with a population of 198,473 making up 8% of the Sarawak 
population of 2,471,140 (Department of Statistics Malaysia, Sarawak, 2012). The 
Bidayuh live in predominantly Bidayuh areas such as Siburan, Serian, Padawan, Bau, 
Lundu and Samarahan. The Bidayuh groups in Bau believe that their ancestors 
originated from the top of Bung Bratak (Bratak Hill) before they dispersed into 
different areas and set up distinct linguistic groups as a result of attacks by warring 
communities. Today, a great majority of Bidayuh in Bau are Christians (Roman 


