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ABSTRACT 

 
Interactional metadiscourse markers allow writers to cultivate readers’ involvement in 
their text. This study analysed interactional metadiscourse markers in 20 high and 20 
low impact Political Science journal articles to: (1) ascertain the most frequently used 
category of markers; (2) compare the distribution of interactional markers between high 
and low impact journal articles; and (3) compare the distribution of markers between 
the abstract, introduction, method and post-method sections of the articles. Using an 
adapted framework from Hyland’s (2005) interpersonal metadiscourse model, markers 
such as hedges, boosters, attitude markers, engagement markers and self-mentions 
were coded. There were 10,903 interactional markers identified within the articles. The 
two journal categories showed similarities in their distribution with boosters as the most 
frequently used marker and engagement markers as the least frequently used marker. 
After boosters, hedges had a significant amount in both categories of articles as well. 
While the distribution of attitude markers and self-mentions varied, the two markers 
were featured more frequently than engagement markers. Boosters dominated most 
section of the articles with hedges at a close second; suggesting the writers’ shared 
familiarity in controlling the strength of their proposition throughout their text.  
 
Keywords: Interactional; metadiscourse; political science; journal; impact  

 
Introduction 

 
As elaborated by Hyland (2017), the concept of metadiscourse regards linguistic items 
as a tool for writers to interact with their readers. It is a fundamental addition to any 
writing material and the exclusion of it would disrupt the flow of information (Hyland, 
2005). The choice of linguistic items depends on a multitude of factors, one of which is 
the author’s affiliated discipline.  
 As reflected in past studies, disciplinary influences can be found in materials 
written by writers of varying levels of experience. Disciplinary differences in 
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