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Abstract 
 
The New Malaysia Education Blueprint (2012) states that the private sector 
continues to have concerns for Malaysian graduates’ English proficiency. The 
present study investigates the views and expectations of science students taking 
English courses in a public university.  The findings revealed that learners saw 
opportunities to communicate and job applications process as important soft skills.  
They preferred practical learning methods above traditional teaching methods. 
Learners considered group performance, personal attitudes and online activities as 
important learning opportunities, while factual knowledge, report writing were least 
supported despite the fact that the majority viewed both assessments and 
instructional process as relevant. The data revealed that though they were 
dissatisfied with their existing level of proficiency, many students continued to 
expect an A for their course. An assessment of the learner’s’ language ability 
revealed that language ability was less under the learner’s control and more 
dependent on learner proficiency level.  Taken together, this study suggests that the 
curriculum for the Professional Writing course should be highly diversified and 
balanced, with some emphasis on getting less proficient learners to read and 
improve their grammar skills while better students should be given opportunities to 
develop creative talents and interpersonal skills. 
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Background 

 
Malaysia’s language education system has undergone several changes over the last 
three decades. Developments in language policies, greater awareness about 
language learning and teaching learning and innovations in technology have brought 
forth a rich variety of  resources and assessment tools that have made it possible to 
address language problems that were once considered remotely possible. 
Nevertheless, despite these enhancements the new Education Blueprint (Ministry of 
Education, 2012) continues to state that public perception of the quality of 
education outcomes remains mixed with expectations continuing to vary across 
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